
 
Electric Vehicle Mission    

 
CONSENT LETTER FROM 

Lead Principal Investigator (LPI) 
 

(It serves as a formal commitment to actively participate in the e-Node's activities within the specified 
technology vertical.) 

 
 

[Date] 
 
To, 
The CEO, ANRF 
 
Subject: Consent and Commitment to Participate in the e-Node's Activities 
 
Dear Sir, 
 
I, (LPI full name) working in (institution name) hereby provide my formal consent and commitment to 
actively participate in the activities of the e-Node for (specify the Technology Vertical and 
corresponding technology domain) under the Electric Vehicle Mission (EVM). 
 
Details of LPI: 
 
Full Name:  
Designation:  
Organization/Company:  
Contact Information:  
 
I understand and acknowledge that the e-Node's objectives align with the mission of advancing EV 
technology and fostering innovation in the chosen EV vertical. I am committed to devote a significant 
part of my time in addition to rendering my knowledge, expertise, and efforts toward the successful 
execution of research and development (R&D) projects and initiatives within the e-Node. 
 
My areas of expertise and research interests relevant to the e-Node's focus on [specify the Technology 
Vertical and corresponding technology domain] include: 
 
[List your specific areas of expertise and research interests] 
 
We will actively collaborate with fellow faculty academic members, researchers, and industry partners 
within the e-Node to achieve the desired outcomes and milestones outlined in the proposal submitted 
to EVM. Further, I am dedicated to supporting capacity building, technology development, and industry 
collaborations as a part of the e-Node's efforts to drive innovation in EV technology. 
 
We are aware of the guidelines, directions, and responsibilities set forth by EVM for e-Node members, 
and I am committed to adhering to them diligently. 
 
Please consider this letter as our formal consent and commitment to partner in the e-Node's activities 
and contribute to the success of EVM to advance the technology. 
 
Thank you for the opportunity given to me to be a part of this transformative initiative. 
 
Sincerely, 
 



 
 
[LPI Signature] 
 [Full Name] 
 

 
 
 
 

Signature of the Head of Organization 
 

Seal 
---------------- 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
  



Electric Vehicle Mission    
 

CONSENT LETTER FROM  
Principal Investigator (s) (PI(s)) 

 
(It serves as a formal commitment to actively participate in the e-Node's activities within the specified 

technology vertical.  
Each PI should sign in separate consent letter form) 

 
[Date] 

 
To, 
The CEO, ANRF 
 
Subject: Consent and Commitment to Participate in the e-Node's Activities 
 
Dear Sir, 
 
I, (PI’s full name) working in (institution name) hereby provide my formal consent and commitment to 
actively participate in the activities of the e-Node for (specify the Technology Vertical and 
corresponding technology domain) under the Electric Vehicle Mission (EVM). 
 
Details of PI: 
 
Full Name:  
Designation:  
Organization/Company:  
Contact Information:  
 
I understand and acknowledge that the e-Node's objectives align with the mission of advancing EV 
technology and fostering innovation in the chosen EV vertical. I am committed to devote a significant 
part of my time in addition to rendering my knowledge, expertise, and efforts toward the successful 
execution of research and development (R&D) projects and initiatives within the e-Node. 
 
My areas of expertise and research interests relevant to the e-Node's focus on [specify the Technology 
Vertical and corresponding technology domain] include: 
 
[List your specific areas of expertise and research interests] 
 
We will actively collaborate with fellow faculty academic members, researchers, and industry partners 
within the e-Node to achieve the desired outcomes and milestones outlined in the proposal submitted 
to EVM. Further, I am dedicated to supporting capacity building, technology development, and industry 
collaborations as a part of the e-Node's efforts to drive innovation in EV technology. 
 
We are aware of the guidelines, directions, and responsibilities set forth by EVM for e-Node members, 
and I am committed to adhering to them diligently. 
 
Please consider this letter as our formal consent and commitment to partner in the e-Node's activities 
and contribute to the success of EVM to advance the technology. 
 
Thank you for the opportunity given to me to be a part of this transformative initiative. 
 
Sincerely, 
 
 



 
[PI’s Signature 
 [Full Name] 
 

 
 
 
 

Signature of the Head of Organization 
 

Seal 
---------------- 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 


